
The Complete Works Of Voltaire: Unlocking
the Revolutionary Genius
The Complete Works of Voltaire encapsulate the essence of the Enlightenment
period. Voltaire, born François-Marie Arouet, was a highly influential French
writer, philosopher, and historian who lived between 1694 and 1778. With his
incisive wit and a deep understanding of human nature, Voltaire's works have left
an indelible mark on the world of literature and philosophy.

Who Was Voltaire?

Voltaire, one of the most prominent figures of the French Enlightenment,
challenged the status quo with his fierce criticism of organized religion,
government oppression, and social inequality. Despite facing censorship and
exile due to his controversial writings, Voltaire never ceased to voice his beliefs.
He defended civil liberties, advocated for justice, and espoused the importance of
reason and intellectual freedom.

As a polymath, Voltaire wrote in various genres, including plays, poems, novels,
essays, historical and scientific works, letters, and philosophical treatises. His
versatility and diverse subject matters made him a formidable force in the literary
world.
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Print length : 3900 pages

The Complete Works: A Treasure Trove for Intellectual Explorers

The Complete Works of Voltaire contain over 100 volumes, consisting of more
than 20,000 letters and approximately 2,000 books. This vast collection
encapsulates the breadth and depth of Voltaire's intellectual prowess, offering
readers a profound insight into his thoughts and ideologies.

Exploring these works is like embarking on a journey through the Enlightenment
era, where reason, knowledge, and critical thinking reigned supreme. Voltaire's
works cover a broad range of disciplines. From literature to philosophy, history to
politics, science to religious tolerance – his writings encompass the full spectrum
of human existence.

Indulging in the Complete Works of Voltaire provides a unique opportunity to
understand the profound societal changes occurring during the 18th century.
Through his writings, readers can witness the clash between traditionalism and
progressivism, monarchy and democracy, and ignorance and enlightenment that
characterized the era.

Key Themes in Voltaire's Works

Voltaire's writings explore numerous themes, each as relevant today as they were
during his time. Here are some significant themes prevalent in his work:

Tolerance and Religious Freedom

Voltaire firmly believed in the importance of religious tolerance. He criticized
bigotry, religious dogmas, and fanaticism, promoting the ideal of coexistence and
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the right to religious freedom for all.

Political Critique

Voltaire was notorious for his satirical criticism of political institutions and corrupt
power structures. His works often exposed the flaws and injustices prevalent in
governments and monarchies of his time, calling for greater accountability and
fair governance.

Social Inequality

Voltaire was an impassioned advocate for social justice, condemning gender and
class inequalities. His writings shed light on the suppression faced by women, the
lower class, and other marginalized groups, advocating for a fair and egalitarian
society.

Rationalism and Freedom of Thought

At the core of Voltaire's philosophy lies the promotion of reason, rational thinking,
and intellectual freedom. He encouraged critical thinking, challenging the dogmas
perpetuated by the religious and political establishments through his scathing wit
and eloquent reasoning.

Legacy of Voltaire's Works

Voltaire's impact on the world of literature, philosophy, and socio-political thought
cannot be overstated. His writings inspire generations to question authority, fight
for justice, and embrace reason. The impact of his works is evident in many
subsequent movements, including the French Revolution and the foundation of
democracies around the world.

Today, the Complete Works of Voltaire stand as a testament to his enduring
influence and intellectual genius. They continue to challenge readers, pave the



way for knowledge and critical thinking, and remind us of the power of words to
shape society.

The Timeless Appeal of Voltaire

With his sharp wit, incisive satire, and unrelenting pursuit of truth, Voltaire
remains an enlightening and thought-provoking writer. Exploring his Complete
Works is an endeavor that promises intellectual stimulation, historical insight, and
the opportunity to engage with the mind of a true intellectual heavyweight.

If you're eager to delve into the world of Voltaire, don't miss the chance to explore
his Complete Works. Embark on a journey of enlightenment, where reason and
critical thought reign supreme, and discover the enduring relevance of his ideas
in our ever-changing world.
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The Complete Works of Voltaire

François-Marie Arouet, known by his nom de plume Voltaire, was a French
Enlightenment writer, historian, and philosopher famous for his wit, his criticism of
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Christianity, especially the Roman Catholic Church, as well as his advocacy of
freedom of speech, freedom of religion, and separation of church and state.

This collection includes the following:

Le Monde comme il va, vision de Babouc

Kaarle XII:n historia

Le Blanc et le Noir

Socrates

Candide ou L'optimisme

Candide

Candide

A Philosophical Dictionary

La mort de César Tragédie en trois actes - avec les changemens fait par le
citoyen Gohier ministre de la justice

Micromégas

Zadig

The History of Peter the Great, Emperor of Russia

Letters on England
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