
What Happened And Why Utah In Middle East
Studies
The field of Middle East Studies has witnessed an intriguing development in
recent years, with the University of Utah emerging as a leading hub for academic
research and educational programs focusing on the region. The fascinating
journey Utah took to become a distinguished institution in Middle East Studies
has been met with curiosity and admiration from scholars and students alike.

So, what exactly happened in Utah and why has it become a prominent player in
the field of Middle East Studies?

Embracing Diversity and Cultural Exchange

One of the primary reasons behind Utah's success in Middle East Studies is its
commitment to embracing diversity and fostering cultural exchange. The
university actively promotes an inclusive environment where students and
scholars from different backgrounds can come together to learn about the Middle
East and engage in meaningful dialogue.
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Utah's Middle East Studies programs offer a wide range of courses covering
various aspects of the region's history, politics, literature, religion, and language.
These courses provide students with a comprehensive understanding of the
Middle East and its complexities, equipping them with the knowledge and skills to
navigate the region's dynamic landscape.

Faculty Excellence and Research Initiatives

Utah's Middle East Studies department boasts a renowned faculty consisting of
world-class scholars and researchers. These experts bring a wealth of knowledge
and expertise to the classroom, ensuring students receive a high-quality
education.

Moreover, the university has established numerous research initiatives in
collaboration with institutions in the Middle East. These initiatives enable faculty
and students to conduct groundbreaking research, fostering innovation and
generating valuable insights into the region's culture, history, and contemporary
issues.

Study Abroad Programs and Experiential Learning

Utah's commitment to providing students with immersive learning experiences
greatly contributes to its success in Middle East Studies. The university offers
study abroad programs that allow students to spend a semester or more in
countries such as Jordan, Egypt, and Oman, among others.

These study abroad programs provide students with firsthand exposure to the
Middle East's culture, language, and societal dynamics. By living and studying in
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the region, students gain a deeper understanding of its intricacies and develop a
global perspective that cannot be achieved solely through classroom education.

Community Engagement and Outreach

Utah's Middle East Studies department actively engages with the local
community through various outreach initiatives. The university hosts public
lectures, cultural events, and conferences that promote intercultural
understanding and dialogue.

Additionally, Utah's Middle East Studies programs collaborate with local schools
and community organizations to offer educational resources and support.
Through these partnerships, the university strives to create a lasting impact by
encouraging individuals to explore the Middle East's rich history and culture.

, the rise of Utah as a prominent player in Middle East Studies can be attributed
to its embrace of diversity, faculty excellence, study abroad programs, and
community engagement. Through its commitment to fostering cultural
understanding and providing high-quality education, the University of Utah has
garnered well-deserved recognition in the field.

As the university continues to expand its programs and partnerships, it is poised
to contribute significantly to the study of the Middle East and play a crucial role in
shaping the region's narrative for years to come.
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Utah Series in Middle East Studies

On July 15, 2016, a faction of the Turkish military attempted to overthrow the
government of President Recep Tayyip Erdoğan. The Turkish government blamed
the unsuccessful coup attempt on Gülenists, adherents of an Islamist movement
led by Fethullah Gülen. They had helped elect Erdoğan and his AK Party, with the
goal of bringing an ostensibly “soft” version of Islam into the secular Turkish
government. In alliance with the AK Party, Gülenists steadfastly increased their
representation in various government institutions, including the military, the
police, and the judiciary. This volume focuses on the historical and sociopolitical
contexts of the Gülen Movement’s origins and political ascendancy along with its
possible role in the failed coup.

 

Editors Yavuz and Balcı are among the first international scholars to have studied
the movement from its nascent stages in Turkey. The volume's contributors
include scholars who have researched the movement in Turkey, Central Asia, and
the Balkans. The result is a comprehensive, timely assessment of numerous
dimensions of Gülenist activities, including its social and political networks and
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the institutions that supported the movement as it became a major economic and
educational force in Turkey and elsewhere. This volume reflects exchanges
among scholars who having studied the Gülenists, assembled to discuss how
and why the movement became belligerent opponents of Erdoğan’s government,
and it addresses questions such as how this major, still continuing disruption in
Turkey’s politics will affect not only the future of the movement but also that of
Turkey's embattled democracy as well.
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